

CNS Dairy Market Basket, Bid# V21220020B - Summary

Line#	Description	UOM	Est. Qty	Alta Dena Option A	Alta Dena Option B	Clearbrook Farms Option A	Clearbrook Farms Option B	Driftwood Option A	Driftwood Option B	Hollandia Bid Price Option A	Hollandia Bid Price Option B
1	MILK, CHOC MILK NONFAT ½ PT	EACH	997,500	\$ 0.2200	\$ 0.2200	NO BID	\$ 0.2400	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.2583	\$ 0.2300
2	JUICE, APPLE JUICE 4 OZ	EACH	769,500	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.1900	NO BID	\$ 0.1300	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.1350	\$ 0.1300
3	JUICE, ORG JUICE 4 OZ	EACH	456,000	\$ 0.2400	\$ 0.2400	NO BID	\$ 0.1500	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.1850	\$ 0.1600
4	JUICE, APPELBERRY, PAPER 4 OZ	EACH	450,000	\$ 0.1900	\$ 0.1900	NO BID	\$ 0.1400	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.1350	\$ 0.1300
5	MILK,1% MILK LOWFAT 1/2 PT	EACH	320,000	\$ 0.2300	\$ 0.2300	NO BID	\$ 0.2500	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.2644	\$ 0.2300
6	MILK, NONFAT 1/2 PT MILK	EACH	150,000	\$ 0.2000	\$ 0.2000	NO BID	\$ 0.2400	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.2584	\$ 0.2150
7	YOGURT 1/2 PT STR/BAN	EACH	10,000	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 0.6200	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.7200	\$ 0.6790
8	YOGURT 1/2 PT PEACH	EACH	5,000	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 0.6200	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.7200	\$ 0.6790
9	YOGURT 1/2 PT STRAWBERRY	EACH	5,000	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 0.6200	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.7200	\$ 0.6790
10	YOGURT, YAMI VANILLA 24/ 8OZ	CASE	600	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 14.8800	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 18.0000	\$ 16.0000
11	YOGURT 1/2 PT VANILLA	EACH	2,500	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 0.6200	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.7500	\$ 0.7000
12	MILK, BUTTERMILK 1/2 GAL	EACH	2,300	\$ 1.5500	\$ 1.5500	NO BID	\$ 2.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2.0000	\$ 1.7500
13	CHEESE STRING CHEESE MOZZ. 1 OZ (96	CASE	2,000	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 24.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 25.0000	\$ 24.0000
14	MILK, NONFAT MILK LACTAID 1/2 PT	EACH	1,600	\$ 0.5800	\$ 0.5800	NO BID	\$ 0.6375	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.7900	\$ 0.7500
15	YOGURT NONFAT STRAW 12/8 OZ.	CASE	1,400	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.5000	\$ 16.0000
16	YOGURT NONFAT STRAW/BANNA 12/ 8	CASE	850	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.5000	\$ 16.0000
17	LF YOGURT PEACH 8OZ 12/CS	CASE	600	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 8.6400	\$ 8.0000
18	YOGURT QUART PLAIN	EACH	650	\$ 3.2700	\$ 3.2700	NO BID	\$ 2.6000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2.8000	\$ 2.5000
19	YOGURT STRAW 48/4oz	CASE	500	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 15.6100	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.0000	\$ 15.0000
20	BUTTER 1# 1/4`STICKS	BOX	500	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 3.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3.7850	\$ 3.2176
21	YOGURT, LF RASP 8OZ 12/CS	CASE	350	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 8.7500	\$ 8.0000
22	YOGURT BLUE RASP/LEM 84/4.4oz	CASE	300	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.0000	\$ 15.3000
23	YOGURT CHRY/LEMON 84/4.4oz	CASE	300	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.0000	\$ 15.3000
24	YOGURT QUART VANILLA	EACH	350	\$ 3.2700	\$ 3.2700	NO BID	\$ 2.6000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2.8000	\$ 2.3800
25	ICE CREAM SAND REDUCED FAT 24/3.5	CASE	300	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.0000	\$ 7.6500
26	FRUIT CUPS KIWI/STRAW 84/4.4 OZ.	CASE	250	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 36.0000	\$ 30.6000
27	YOGURT, NONFAT VAN 48/4 OZ.	CASE	200	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 20.0000	\$ 17.0000
28	BAR LF FUDGE BAR (24 CT) FROZEN	CASE	150	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 7.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 7.0000	\$ 5.9500
29	YOGURT PARFAIT PRO VAN CS 6/4#	CASE	150	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 38.8000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 34.0000	\$ 28.9000
30	BAR LOW F. COOKIE N CR BAR 24/CASE FROZEN	CASE	70	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.0000	\$ 7.6500
31	BAR ORANGE DREAM BAR (24 CT)	CASE	70	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 7.8000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 7.5000	\$ 6.3750
32	CHEESE FETA CRUMBLD 2.5 #	CASE	50	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 15.7100	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 41.7500	\$ 38.2500
33	ICE CREAM LF MINI IC CONE (24 CT)	CASE	50	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 10.5000	\$ 10.0000

CNS Dairy Market Basket, Bid# V21220020B - Summary

Line#	Description	UOM	Est. Qty	Alta Dena Option A	Alta Dena Option B	Clearbrook Farms Option A	Clearbrook Farms Option B	Driftwood Option A	Driftwood Option B	Hollandia Bid Price Option A	Hollandia Bid Price Option B
34	MILK SOY 24/8 OZ.	CASE	30	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 18.8000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 21.0000	\$ 19.0000
35	YOGURT CHERRY (48/4oz)	CASE	30	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 15.6100	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.0000	\$ 15.3000
36	CHEESE CREAM CHEESE (100/1oz) CUPS	CASE	600	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 17.7500	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 19.5000	\$ 18.0000
37	CHEESE CREAM CHEESE 3#	CASE	100	\$ 7.2400	\$ 7.2400	NO BID	\$ 6.7500	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 10.2500	\$ 9.5000
38	LARGE LOOSE 15 DZ EGGS	CASE	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 37.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 34.0000	\$ 32.0000
39	ALMOND MILK (1/2 PINT)	CASE	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 20.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 25.0000	\$ 23.0000
40	YOGURT PARFAIT PRO BLUEBERRY 6/4# SLEEVES	CASE	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 34.0000	\$ 31.0000
41	YOGURT PARFAIT PRO STRAWBERRY 6/4# SLEEVES	CASE	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 34.0000	\$ 31.0000
42	MILK, STRAWBERRY FATFREE 1/2 PT	EACH	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 0.2600	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.2793	\$ 0.2500
43	TRIX STR BANANA BLST 4OZ 48/CS	CASE	300	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 15.6100	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 18.0000	\$ 15.3000
44	LF VANILLA IC SAND SB12 2-DZ	CASE	180	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 8.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.0000	\$ 8.5000
45	STRAW /BANANA 4 OZ 48/CASE	CASE	180	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 15.6100	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.0000	\$ 15.3000
46	POLAR POLE RAINBOW 2-DZ	CASE	75	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 9.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 10.5000	\$ 9.7500
47	LACTAID 1/2 PT 20/CS	CASE	75	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 8.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.4800	\$ 9.2500
48	PEACH 4OZ 48/CASE	CASE	60	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 20.0000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 17.0000	\$ 15.3000
49	CHOCOLATE SHORTCAKE SB12 2-DZ	CASE	40	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 8.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.0000	\$ 8.7500
50	BAR SIDEKICKS,SOUR CHRY-LMN 84-4.4	CASE	30	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 35.0000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 36.0000	\$ 35.0000
51	BAR SIDEKICKS,STRAW-MANGO 84-4.4OZ	CASE	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 35.0000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 36.0000	\$ 35.0000
52	Soy Milk Chocolate 1/2PT 24/CS	CASE	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 22.0000	\$ 21.0000
53	EGGS LARGE CARTONED PER DZ	CARTON	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 2.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3.0000	\$ 2.7500
54	SIDEKICKS BLUE RASPBERRY	CASE	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 35.0000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 36.0000	\$ 35.0000
55	RICH'S ICE CREAM SANDWICH	CASE	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 8.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.0000	\$ 8.7500
56	STRAWBERRY SHORTCAKE BAR	CASE	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 8.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 9.0000	\$ 8.7500
57	CRUMBLED COOKIE CONE	CASE	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 10.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 10.2500	\$ 10.0000
58	SOUR SWELL CHERRY	CASE	10	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 7.5000	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 7.5000	\$ 7.2500
59	MILK,FF MILK 1/GA	GA	1600	\$ 2.9500	\$ 2.9500	NO BID	\$ 3.1500	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2.5000	\$ 2.5000